4/30/2025 6:31:32 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

PROJECT TEAM

FINAL SUBMITTAL ( DRB25-1096) PROJECT INFORMATION

OWNER'S PROJECT MANAGER

CACTUS CLUB CAFE

201 - 550 WEST BROADWAY

VANCOUVER, BC V5Z 1E9

CONTACT: DUNCAN BATH

E: DUNCANBATH@CACTUSCLUBCAFE.COM

INTERIOR DESIGN

JEFFREY BEERS INTERNATIONAL

250 GREENWICH STREET, 33RD FLOOR

NEW YORK, NY 10007

PRINCIPAL IN CHARGE: MICHAEL PANDOLFI, AIA
PROJECT MANAGER: TEDDY ACERO

SCOPE OF WORK: PROPOSED FACADE IMPROVEMENT, RECLADDING WALL AND GLAZING INFILL, NEW SIGNAGE, PRIVACY FENCE ENCLOSURE FOR EQUIPMENT
LEGAL DESCRIPTION: LOTS 10, 11 AND 12, BLOCK 51, OF OCEAN BEACH ADDITION NO. 3, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 2, PAGE 81, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF MIAMI - DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA.
OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION: A-2

ALTERATION CLASSIFICATION: LEVEL 3
FIRE ALARM SYSTEM & SPRINKLER SYSTEM: YES; NFPA 72 SYSTEM /NFPA 13 SYSTEM

T: 604.967.3740 T: 315.619.3533

%ECTURE, INC. WMER + SEMLER LANDSCAPE ARCHITECTURE) S H E ET I N D EX
51 SLEEPER STREET, 6TH FLOOR 17670 NW 78TH AVENUE, SUITE 214
ggﬁvT(JCI)SAI’iAmOgaLORGE: MATTHEW HYATT ?Jﬂé)Al\’l\q]Azli'?i(l)E1l\fGARDNER, ASLA, LEED AP SH EET CU RRENT REV|S|ON SH EET CU RRENT REV|S|ON
EMAL SCHESRONGBERGMEVER COM S NO. SHEET NAVE NO.[ISSUEDATE|  DESCRIPTION NO. SHEET NAVE NO.[ISSUEDATE|  DESCRIPTION
T:617.:542:1025 11a FINAL SUBMITTAL (DRB25-1096) - COVER | 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL 121 EXISTING TREE DISPOSTION PLAN 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
SHEET 12.2 EXISTING TREE DISPOSITION LIST 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
11b SITE SURVEY 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL 18 CONTEXTUAL ELEVATION LINE 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
APPLICABLE CODES 11c_ |ZONING DATA 6 | 05022025 [DRB- FINAL SUBMITTAL DRAWINGS
11d CONTEXTUAL LOCATION PLAN 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL 27 SCHEMATIC SIGNAGE PROGRAM 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
STATE BUILDING CODE: 2023 Florida Building Code, Building, 8th Edition 11h SITE PLAN 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL 42a SITE PLAN 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
FIRE / LIFE SAFETY CODE: |Florida Fire Prevention Code (FFPC), 8th edition - Fire Code 11i.1 CONTEXTUAL SITE PHOTOS 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL 43 OCCUPANT LOAD & PROPOSED SEATS 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
ACCESSIBILITY CODE: 2023 Florida Building Code, Accessibility; 2010 ADA Standards for 11i.2 CONTEXTUAL SITE PHOTOS 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB-FINAL SUBMITTAL
Accessible Design 11j.1 CONTEXTUAL INTERIOR PHOTOS 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
PLUMBING CODE: 2023 Florida Building Code, Plumbing, 8th Edition 11j.2 CONTEXTUAL INTERIOR PHOTOS 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
MECHANICAL CODE: 2023 Florida Building Code, Mechanical, 8th Edition 11k CONTEXTUAL EXTERIOR PHOTOS 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
ELECTRICAL CODE: Florida Electrical Code 2020; NFPA 70, 2020 1111 EXISTING CONDITIONS PLAN - FIRST 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
ENERGY CODE: 2023 Florida Building Code, Energy Conservation, 8th Edition FLOOR / MEZZ.
EXISTING BUILDING CODE: |2023 Florida Building Code, Existing Building, 8th Edition 111.2 EXISTING CONDITIONS ELEVATIONS 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
1113 EXISTING CONDITIONS ELEVATIONS 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
LOC AT|ON MAP 11m.1 '\DAEI\Z/IQLITION PLAN - FIRST FLOOR/ 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
11m.2  |DEMOLITION ELEVATIONS 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
11m.3  |DEMOLITION ELEVATIONS 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
11n.1  |PROPOSED FLOOR PLAN - FIRSTFLOOR/| 6 | 05.02.2025 [DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
MEZZ.
11n.2  |PROPOSED FLOOR PLAN - ENLARGED 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
EXTERIOR
STE 11n.3  |PROPOSED ROOF PLAN 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
LocaioN § [110.1  [PROPOSED ELEVATIONS 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
110.2  |PROPOSED ELEVATIONS 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
110.3  |EXTERIOR MATERIALS 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
11g.1  |EXTERIOR FRONT ELEVATION 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
RENDERING
11g.2  |EXTERIOR REAR ELEVATION RENDERING| 6 | 05.02.2025 [DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
11g.3  |EXTERIOR VIEW 1- DAY 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
114  |EXTERIOR VIEW 1-NIGHT 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
11g.5  |EXTERIOR VIEW 2 - DAY 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
119.6  |EXTERIOR VIEW 2 - NIGHT 6 | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL
BAI Arch;tectu re FINAL SUBMITTAL (DRB25-1096) - COVER SHEET JOB# 20240136
5os got A CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE: 1 1 3
51 Sleeper St 875 N High St. 360 E2"St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025
Boston MA 02210 Gelumbus, OH 43215 Los Angales, GA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 | EP |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


-->LAYOUT: SHEET 1

H:\2024\FLC240084.00\SURVEY\CADIDRAWINGS\SURVEY\S-ALTA-SURV-FLC240084.00.2A-

EEE

NOTES:

1. THE SUBJECT PROPERTY THE LANDS OF LIMESTONE PLANT LLC, AS RECORDED IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 33193, PAGE 2721, AMONG
THE LAND RECORDS OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA AND HAVING A FOLIO NUMBER OF 02-4203-009-2100 PER THE MIAMI-DADE
COUNTY PROPERTY APPRAISER. THE PROPERTY IS LYING IN SECTION 3; TOWNSHIP 54 SOUTH; RANGE 42 EAST.

2. OVERALL AREA = 9,000 SQUARE FEET OR 0.207 ACRES (MEASURED)

4. LOCATION OF ALL UNDERGROUND UTILITIES ARE APPROXIMATE, SOURCE INFORMATION FROM PLANS AND MARKINGS HAS BEEN
COMBINED WITH OBSERVED EVIDENCE OF UTILITIES TO DEVELOP A VIEW OF THOSE UNDERGROUND UTILITIES. HOWEVER, LACKING
EXCAVATION, THE EXACT LOCATION OF UNDERGROUND FEATURES CANNOT BE ACCURATELY, COMPLETELY AND RELIABLY DEPICTED.
WHERE ADDITIONAL OR MORE DETAILED INFORMATION IS REQUIRED, THE CLIENT IS ADVISED THAT EXCAVATION MAY BE NECESSARY.

5. THIS SURVEY WAS PERFORMED IN THE FIELD ON NOVEMBER 26, 2024 UTILIZING THE REFERENCE DOCUMENTS AS LISTED HEREON AND
DEPICTS BUILDINGS, STRUCTURES AND OTHER IMPROVEMENTS. REVISIONS LISTED ON THIS SURVEY APPLY ONLY TO THE SPECIFIC
CHANGES REFERENCED, AND DO NOT CONSTITUTE AN UPDATE OF OTHER DATA ON THIS SURVEY. THE "SURVEY DATE" SHOWN
HEREON IS THE APPLICABLE DATE AS RELATED TO PROVISIONS OF STATUTES OF LIMITATION UNLESS NOTED OTHERWISE.

o

ELEVATIONS ARE BASED ON NGVD29 DATUM DETERMINED BY GPS OBSERVATIONS AND TIED IN TO THE NGS BENCHMARK NAMED
D-142-R WITH A PUBLISHED ELEVATION OF 3.87 FEET.

7. THE PROPERTY IS LOCATED IN SPECIAL FLOOD HAZARD AREAS SUBJECT TO INUNDATION BY THE 1% ANNUAL CHANCE FLOOD ZONE AE
(BASE FLOOD ELEVATIONS DETERMINED) PER MAP ENTITLED “FIRM, FLOOD INSURANCE RATE MAP, MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA AND
INCORPORATED AREAS, PANEL 319 OF 1031, COMMUNITY-PANEL NUMBER 12086C0319L, WITH A MAP EFFECTIVE DATE OF SEPTEMBER
11, 2009.

8. NO ZONING REPORT OR ZONING LETTER WAS PROVIDED TO THE SURVEYOR.

9. NO SURVEY OF SUBTERRANEAN STRUCTURES OR INTERIOR SPACES SUCH AS FOOTINGS, FOUNDATIONS, VAULTS OR BASEMENTS WAS
PERFORMED AS PART OF THIS LAND SURVEY, AND THIS PLAN SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS CERTIFICATION TO THE EXISTENCE OR
LOCATION OF THE SAME.

10. THERE IS NO RECENT EVIDENCE OF EARTH MOVING WORK, BUILDING CONSTRUCTION OR BUILDING ADDITIONS OBSERVED IN THE
PROCESS OF CONDUCTING THE FIELDWORK.

. THERE ARE NOT ANY CHANGES IN STREET RIGHT OF WAY LINES EITHER COMPLETED OR PROPOSED, AND AVAILABLE FROM THE
CONTROLLING JURISDICTION AND THERE IS NO EVIDENCE OF RECENT STREET OR SIDEWALK CONSTRUCTION OR REPAIRS OBSERVED
IN THE PROCESS OF CONDUCTING THE FIELDWORK.

12. TREES 3 INCHES DIAMETER AT BREAST HEIGHT (DBH) AND LARGER HAVE BEEN LOCATED WITHIN THE PROJECT BOUNDARY. SEE
REFERENCED ARBORIST REPORT INFORMATION SHOWN HEREON.

13. THERE ARE NO VISIBLE ENCROACHMENTS EXCEPT AS SHOWN ON THE SURVEY. ENCROACHMENT IS A LEGAL CONDITION, NOT A
MATTER OF SURVEY AND, AS A RESULT, THERE MAY BE OTHER POSSIBLE ENCROACHMENTS AFFECTING THE PROPERTY THAT ARE NOT
SHOWN.

=

THE PROPERTY HAS DIRECT ACCESS ALONG COMMERCE STREET ON THE NORTH SIDE OF THE PROPERTY.

15. BOHLER WAS NOT MADE AWARE OF ANY WETLAND DELINEATION PERFORMED ON THE SUBJECT PROPERTIES AND THERE WERE NO
WETLAND FLAGS OBSERVED AT THE TIME OF THE FIELD SURVEY.

16. THIS SURVEY WAS PREPARED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE “STANDARDS OF PRACTICE", AS SET FORTH BY THE FLORIDA BOARD OF
PROFESSIONAL SURVEYORS AND MAPPERS IN RULES 5J-17.050 THROUGH 5J-17.053, OF THE FLORIDA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE.

17. BASIS OF BEARINGS: THE BEARINGS SHOWN HEREON ARE RELATIVE TO THE FLORIDA STATE PLANE COORDINATE SYSTEM, EAST ZONE,
NORTH AMERICAN DATUM OF 1983 - 2011 ADJUSTMENT, HOLDING THE NORTH LINE OF LOTS 10, 11 AND 12, AS BEING NORTH 88°28'03"
EAST, AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 2, PAGE 81.

®

ALL DISTANCES ARE MEASURED GROUND DISTANCES UNLESS NOTED OTHERWISE.

©

ADDITIONS OR DELETIONS TO SURVEY MAPS OR REPORTS BY ANYONE OTHER THAN THE SIGNING PARTY OR PARTIES IS PROHIBITED
WITHOUT WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE SIGNING PARTY OR PARTIES.

20. THIS SURVEY WAS PREPARED FOR THE PARTIES LISTED BELOW AND IS NOT ASSIGNABLE:
BAI ARCHITECTURE, INC.

21. THIS MAP IS INTENDED TO BE DEPICTED AT A SCALE OF 1"=40' ON 11"X17" SHEETS. UNITS SHOWN ARE U.S. SURVEY FEET.

22. SOME TOPOGRAPHIC FEATURES MAY BE EXAGGERATED IN SCALE FOR CLARITY. THE CENTER OF THE SYMBOL OF SUCH FEATURES IS
THE CORRECT LOCATIONS.

23. © COPYRIGHT 2025 BY BOHLER ENGINEERING FL, LLC.

REPRODUCTIONS OF THIS SURVEY ARE NOT VALID WITHOUT THE ORIGINAL SIGNATURE AND STAMP, OR A DIGITALLY VERIFIED
ELECTRONIC SIGNATURE AND SEAL, OF A FLORIDA LICENSED SURVEYOR AND MAPPER EMPLOYED BY BOHLER ENGINEERING FL, LLC.

TITLE DESCRIPTION:

LOTS 10, 11 AND 12, BLOCK 51, OF OCEAN BEACH ADDITION NO. 3, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 2,
PAGE 81, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF MIAMI - DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA.

UTILITIES:

THE FOLLOWING COMPANIES WERE NOTIFIED BY SUNSHINE 811 UTILITY SYSTEM (1-800-432-4770) AND REQUESTED TO MARK OUT
UNDERGROUND FACILITIES AFFECTING AND SERVICING THIS SITE. THE UNDERGROUND UTILITY INFORMATION SHOWN HEREON IS
BASED UPON THE UTILITY COMPANIES RESPONSE TO THIS REQUEST. SERIAL NUMBER(S): 318404382

UTILITY COMPANY LOCATE STATUS PHONE NUMBER

(888) 357-1922

AT &T/DISTRIBUTION NO CONFLICT

BREEZELINE CLEAR NO FACILITIES (800) 778-9140

CITY OF MIAMI BEACH MARKED (305) 673-7080 x26886
COMCAST CABLE NO CONFLICT (800) 778-9140
CROWN CASTLE MARKED (800) 654-3110
CROWN CASTLE NG MARKED (801) 364-1063
NO CONFLICT (786) 345-0988

DADE COUNTY PUBLIC WORKS AND
TRAFFIC

FLORIDA POWER & LIGHT--DADE CLEAR NO FACILITIES (800) 778-9140

HOTWIRE COMMUNICATIONS ACTIVE FACILITIES ARE PRESENT (561) 703-4965

MIAMI DADE WATER UNMARKED (786) 268-5369
MIAMI-DADE - SEWER NO CONFLICT (786) 268-5369
TECO PEOPLES GAS SOUTH FLORIDA UNMARKED (813) 557-5971

VERIZON WIRELESS CLEAR NO FACILITIES

(919) 377-4328

TREE SURVEY NOTES:

BASED ON AN ARBORIST REPORT PROVIDED BY MARK C. WILLIAMS FL-5221 AM, ISA CERTIFIED ARBORIST
MUNICIPAL SPECIAL DATED JANUARY 30, 2025 AND PROVIDED TO BOHLER.

>\

FCS NADB3/2011
EAST ZONE

S

BENCHMARK

MAL & DISK IV PAVEMENT
TRUVERSE BOHLER: L& 8085”
AFY=195

wris ‘ ‘

OWWY

PEB 2 PG 81

ALK WAL /5‘%

orE oFIHER

L |
#5564 |

7- sm/?y > |
i

BLOCK BUILDING

HI=£712"

%6’

L2 |

~ OHEFTHEEF ‘

x
-
jom

FPL EASEMENT
ORE. 29046, 1% J/z

A
‘0/7& 2899]_F8 ]33
% J9.9

wr 17

#554 & £557

— STORY

BLOCK BULOING |

AREA: 27,020 SF. |
HI=220" |
Lots 1012 |
BLOCK 51

|
& "OCEAN BEACH ADDITION NO. 3"
|
EMW sar

P.B. 2, PG. 81 ‘

LANDSOF |

LIMESTONE PLANT LLC

C/O ORION REAL ESTATE GROUP  gypyc 55 21

FOLIO: 02-4203-009-2100
O.R.B. 33193, PG. 2721

ASEMENT ~F7=4 4]f

COME:

70 THE W, OF THE £

1INIZS FPL EASEMENT
8. 26885 FY. J956

JEFFERSON A )VE/VUE
(PALM AVE — PLAT)

GRATE INLET -

CLEAR HEALTH RELOCATION
TREE HEIGHT | WIDTH | DBH HEALTH TREE
# COMMON NAME | BOTANICAL NAME e i) in) TRUNK CONDITION CONDITION DISPOSITION CANDIDATE OBSERVATIONS
() E YNy
1 |MexanderPaim  |Ptychospema slegans 3 B 750 28 Fair 49% N Florida Invasive 5 pecies Counil Category Il Invasive, Nutrient deficiency
2 |MexanderPaim  |Ptychosperma elegans 31 8 750 28 Fair 49% N Florida Invasive S pecies Coundil Category Il Invasive, Nutriert deficiency
3 |Crape Wyrile L agerstroemia ndica 15 7 425 Good 65% Y
4 |MexanderPaim  |Ptychospemaslegans 0 s 750 27 Fair 6% N Florida Invasive S pecies Coundil Catsaory Il nvasive, Nutrient deficiency
5 |Alexander Paim Ptychosperna elegans 7.50 Dead 0% N Dead Paim
& |Aexander Paim Ptychosperma elegans 339 6 9.00 H Fair 49% N Florida Invasive Species Coundl Category Il iInvasive, Nutrient deficiency
7 |Crape Myrtle L agerstroemia indica 12 10 350 Good B85% k4
& |Alexander Paim Ptychosperma elegans p<] 7.00 Dead 0% N Dead Paim
8 |Alexander Paim FPlychospemma elegans 282 6 9.00 26 Fair 46% N Florida Invasive Species Coundil Category Il Invasive, Nutrient deficiency
0 |Green Buttonwood |Conocampus erectus 308 22 11.00 Fair 48% N Poor structure, confined canopy and rooi space, heading cuts
1 |Green Buttonwood [Conocamus erectus % 5 Poor 20% N Poorstructure, confined canopy and root space, heading cuts, canopy
dieback, canopy crowding
12 |Green Buttonwood (Conocampus erectus H 14 8.00 Fair 48% N z_uﬂlﬁ:‘r:mm' confried canopy znilrod space; fieading culs; canopy
T 4 - - - s W Poor structure, confined canapy and root space, heading cuts, canopy
dieback, canopy crowding
14 |Green Buttonwood |Conocamus erectus 2 14 s oo a7 N Poorstructure, confined canopy and root space, heading culs, canopy
crovaing, trunk lean
) | R o % e i Sl i Poor structure, confined canopy and roct space, heading cuts, tunk lean,
support post drilled into trunk

BNCHHARK
=192 MAL & DISK 1N CONCRETE
ST M- TRUVERSE BOHLER L&, 8085™
=199 AEY=417

S8E°00°03"W(M)

90.00'(M&P)

8 BLOCK WAL

#8353
" STORY
BLOCK BULDING

BOTTOW=—-16.49

LEGEND
CRF CAPPED IRON REBAR FOUND é LICENSE BUSINESS
RS CAPPED IRON REBAR SET PID. PROPERTY IDENTIFICATION
I3 IRON REBAR FOUND L4 RIGHT-OF-WAY
conr CONCRETE MONUMENT FOUND - FINISH FLOOR
NoF NAIL & DISK FOUND Hr HEIGHT
oRB. OFFICIAL RECORD BOOK (M) MEASURED
. PAGE PLAT
Pa PLAT BOOK - EXISTING CONTOUR
() TYPICAL EXISTING SPOT ELEVATION
n NORTH EXIST. TOP OF CURB ELEVATION
S. SOUTH e ;’; g EXIST. GUTTER ELEVATION
E EAST = WATER VALVE
" WEST " WATER METER
oHL DASHED WHITE LINE ®” POST INDICATOR VALVE
DSYL DOUBLE SOLID YELLOW LINE ®” FLOOR DRAIN
cone. CONCRETE &' GAS METER
¢ CENTERLINE GAS VALVE
4 PROPERTY LINE @ CLEAN OUT
LSA LANDSCAPED AREA & ELECTRIC BOX
# PLUS OR MINUS =B TRANSFORMER
o CORRUGATED METAL PIPE - SIGN
7 POLYVINYL CHLORIDE o BOLLARD
P CORRUGATED PLASTIC PIPE [©) SANITARY MANHOLE
A AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT G STORM DRAIN MANHOLE
w MANHOLE ] COVER
724 ELEVATION @ TITLE REPORT EXCEPTION
SF. SQUARE FOOT & BENCHMARK
w0 ACRE (-] PROP. CORNER TO BE SET
%3 NOW OR FORMERLY o TREE (SIZE AS NOTED)
w INVERT 7 PALM TREE (SIZE AS NOTED)
fes FLORIDA COORDINATE SYSTEM fe3 AREA LIGHT
o NORTH AMERICAN DATUM _— GUY WIRE
o NATIONAL GEODETIC VERTICAL DATUM -o- UTILITY POLE
s NATIONAL GEODETIC SURVEY OH ———  OVERHEAD WIRES

co 70%P/GH7 OF—WAY L"'-
) ASPHALT PAVED ng[/ﬁ ROADWAY
P.B. 3

| S01°59'57"

‘wf:mjiﬁ J’
SN
BULONG 15 2.5 ’
N OFTES /70 mrﬁﬁ
" Yo Aners~
546
wre 4/ 7 s7oRY|
g
s - BLOCK BUILOIVG
(ALE O OPE) - \r HI=255"
4 M o
PRV DZIR AN
N

CE S

87

wré

F("”)

\100 00 (M&

FOLIO: 02— 42[7] J65—-0007

=
L

2

£ 940500

SOUTH POIN

SITE LOCATION MAP
SCALE: 1"=1,000
SOURCE: AUTODESK GEOLOCATION MAP

TITLE NOTES:

THIS SURVEY IS PREPARED WITH REFERENCE TO A COMMITMENT FOR TITLE INSURANCE PREPARED BY FIDELITY NATIONAL
TITLE INSURANCE COMPANY, COMMITMENT NUMBER: 12194520, WITH A COMMITMENT DATE OF DECEMBER 26, 2024. OUR
OFFICE HAS REVIEWED THE FOLLOWING SURVEY RELATED SCHEDULE B, PART Il EXCEPTIONS FROM COVERAGE:

(6) RESTRICTIONS, COVENANTS, CONDITIONS, EASEMENTS AND OTHER MATTERS AS CONTAINED ON THE PLAT OF
OCEAN BEACH ADDITION NO. 3, RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 2, PAGE 81, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF MIAMI-DADE COUNTY,
FLORIDA; AFFECT THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, PLOTTABLE ITEMS SHOWN.

@ TERMS AND PROVISIONS OF THAT AGREEMENT WITH THE DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY AFFAIRS, RECORDED IN
FFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 16788, PAGE 3089; AFFECT THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, NOT A SURVEY MATTER.

TERMS, PROVISIONS AND RESTRICTIONS CONTAINED IN THAT PRELIMINARY DEVELOPMENT AGREEMENT FOR
PORTOFINO DRI, RECORDED IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 17283, PAGE 1933; AFFECT THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, NOT A
SURVEY MATTER.

TERMS, PROVISIONS AND RESTRICTIONS CONTAINED IN THAT NOTICE OF ADOPTION OF A DEVELOPMENT ORDER FOR
THE ALTERNATIVE PORTOFINO DRI IN THE CITY OF MIAMI BEACH, MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA, RECORDED IN OFFICIAL
RECORDS BOOK 18541, PAGE 3641, MODIFIED BY THOSE INSTRUMENTS RECORDED IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 18792,
PAGE 1530, OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 19699, PAGE 1422, OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 19699, PAGE 1480, OFFICIAL RECORDS
BOOK 21638, PAGE 2906 AND IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 22636, PAGE 2066; AFFECT THE SUBJECT PROPERTY. NOT A
SURVEY MATTER.

TERMS, PROVISIONS AND RESTRICTIONS CONTAINED IN THAT NOTICE OF ADOPTION OF DEVELOPMENT ORDER FOR

E PORTOFINO DRI DEVELOPMENT OF REGIONAL IMPACT IN THE CITY OF MIAMI BEACH, MIAMI-DADE COUNTY, FLORIDA,

RECORDED IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 22758, PAGE 2571. AFFECT THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, CONTAINS COVENANTS, NO
PLOTTABLE ITEMS.

DECLARATION OF RESTRICTIVE COVENANTS IN LIEU OF UNITY OF TITLE, RECORDED IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK
636, PAGE 2072; AFFECT THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, CONTAINS COVENANTS, NO PLOTTABLE ITEMS.

@ TERMS, CONDITIONS, COVENANTS AND OTHER MATTERS SET FORTH IN THE ORDER OF THE DESIGN REVIEW BOARD
OF THE CITY OF MIAMI BEACH, FLORIDA, RECORDED OCTOBER 18, 2011, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 27862, PAGE 596;
AFFECTS THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, NOT A SURVEY MATTER.

TERMS, CONDITIONS, COVENANTS AND OTHER MATTERS SET FORTH IN THE ORDER OF THE DESIGNER REVIEW
BOARD OF THE CITY OF MIAMI BEACH RECORDED DECEMBER 20, 2012, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 28408, PAGE 4335;
AFFECT THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, NOT A SURVEY MATTER.

TERMS, CONDITIONS, COVENANTS AND OTHER MATTERS SET FORTH IN THE ORDER OF THE BOARD OF ADJUSTMENT
THE CITY OF MIAMI BEACH RECORDED DECEMBER 20, 2012, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 28408, PAGE 4435. DUPLICATE.

HOLD HARMLESS COVENANT RUNNING WITH THE LAND RECORDED JANUARY 17, 2013, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK
28449, PAGE 4210; AFFECTS THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, NOT A SURVEY MATTER.

EASEMENT IN FAVOR OF FLORIDA POWER & LIGHT COMPANY RECORDED OCTOBER 28, 2013, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS
BOOK 28885, PAGE 3956; AFFECTS THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, EASEMENT SHOWN.

@ EASEMENT IN FAVOR OF FLORIDA POWER & LIGHT COMPANY RECORDED OCTOBER 30, 2013, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS
OOK 28889, PAGE 2340; AFFECTS THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, EASEMENT SHOWN.

EASEMENT IN FAVOR OF FLORIDA POWER & LIGHT COMPANY RECORDED JANUARY 1, 2014, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS
BOOK 28991, PAGE 1393; AFFECTS THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, EASEMENT SHOWN.

EASEMENT IN FAVOR OF FLORIDA POWER & LIGHT COMPANY RECORDED FEBRUARY 27, 2014, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS
BOOK 29046, PAGE 3142; AFFECTS THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, EASEMENT SHOWN.

DECLARATION OF RESTRICTIVE COVENANT RECORDED APRIL 1, 2014, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 29090, PAGE 4614;
AFFECTS THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, CONTAINS COVENANTS, NO PLOTTABLE ITEMS.

(1) SUPPLEMENTAL MODIFIED ORDER OF THE DESIGN REVIEW BOARD OF THE CITY OF MIAMI BEACH, FLORIDA,
RECORDED DECEMBER 12, 2016, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 30340, PAGE 3121; AFFECT THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, NOT A
SURVEY MATTER.

COVENANT IN LIEU OF UNITY OF TITLE FOR PARKING RECORDED AUGUST 18, 2017, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 30661,
GE 912; AFFECTS THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, CONTAINS COVENANTS, NO PLOTTABLE ITEMS.

@ COVENANT IN LIEU OF UNITY OF TITLE FOR PARKING RECORDED AUGUST 18, 2017, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 30661,
GE 1124; AFFECTS THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, CONTAINS COVENANTS, NO PLOTTABLE ITEMS.

TERMS, CONDITIONS AND OTHER MATTERS AS SET FORTH IN THE LEASE AGREEMENT DATED NOVEMBER 21, 2012, AS
AMENDED BY THE FIRST AMENDMENT DATED SEPTEMBER 16, 2013, BY AND BETWEEN COMMERCE STREET PROPERTIES,
LLC, A FLORIDA LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY, LESSOR, AND 850 COMMERCE RESTAURANT, LLC, A FLORIDA LIMITED
LIABILITY COMPANY, LESSEE, AS EVIDENCED BY THE SUBORDINATION, NON-DISTURBANCE AND ATTORNMENT AGREEMENT
RECORDED OCTOBER 15, 2013, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 28866, PAGE 4310; AFFECTS THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, NOT A
SURVEY MATTER.

TERMS, CONDITIONS AND OTHER MATTERS AS SET FORTH IN THE LEASE DATED JULY 27, 2017, BY AND BETWEEN
COMMERCE STREET PROPERTIES, LLC, A FLORIDA LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY, LESSOR, AND CHG PLANTA MIAMI, INC., A
FLORIDA CORPORATION, LESSEE, AS EVIDENCED BY THE SUBORDINATION, NON-DISTURBANCE AND ATTORNMENT
AGREEMENT RECORDED SEPTEMBER 27, 2017, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 30696, PAGE 3689; AFFECT THE SUBJECT
PROPERTY, NOT A SURVEY MATTER.

MORTGAGE AND SECURITY AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN LIMESTONE PLANT, LLC, A FLORIDA LIMITED LIABILITY
COMPANY, MORTGAGOR, AND FIRST NATIONAL BANK OF SOUTH MIAMI, MORTGAGEE, DATED APRIL 29, 2022, RECORDED
MAY 8, 2022 IN OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 33193, PAGE 2727; AFFECT THE SUBJECT PROPERTY, NOT A SURVEY MATTER.

TERMS, CONDITIONS, AND PROVISIONS OF THE LEASE AGREEMENT BY AND BETWEEN LIMESTONE PLANT, LLC, A
FLORIDA LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY, LESSOR, AND CACTUS CAFE SOUTH BEACH INC., A DELAWARE CORPORATION,
LESSEE, DATED __, AS EVIDENCED BY THAT CERTAIN MEMORANDUM OF LEASE RECORDED __, IN OFFICIAL RECORDS
BOOK _, PAGE __ (TO BE RECORDED).

BOHLER

©BOHLER

LAND SURVEYING
PROGRAM MANAGEMENT
LANDSCAPE ARCHITECTURE
SUSTAINABLE DESIGN
PERMITTING SERVICES
TRANSPORTATION SERVICES

Qvaseron

SITE CIVIL AND CONSULTING ENGINEERING

TR

REVISIONS

RE)

<

DRAWNEY

DATE [cHECKED BY

COMMENT

ADDED TREE SURVEY

PROJECT No.:
DRAWN BY:
CHECKED BY:

DATE:

CADI.D.:

FIELD

CREW CHIEF: JV.
APPROVED:

FLC240084.00.2A
AS.

sMm
01/31/2025
S-ALTA-SURV
DATE: 12126/2024

C.W.

Cal

business days before digging to have
buried facilities located and marked.

Check pasitive response codes before you dig!

Sunshine@

Il 811 or visit sunshine811.com two full

PROJECT:

ALTAINSPS
LAND TITLE
SURVEY

ARCHITECTURE, INC.

FOR

BAI

850 COMMERCE STREET
CITY OF MIAMI BEACH
MIAMI DADE COUNTY

TO:
FIDELITY NATIONAL TITLE INSURANCE COMPANY; BAI ARCHITECTURE, INC.; & LIMESTONE
PLANT LLC, A FLORIDA LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY;

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THIS MAP OR PLAT AND THE SURVEY ON WHICH IT IS BASED
WERE MADE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE 2021 MINIMUM STANDARD DETAIL REQUIREMENTS
FOR ALTA/NSPS LAND TITLE SURVEYS, JOINTLY ESTABLISHED AND ADOPTED BY ALTA AND
NSPS, AND INCLUDES ITEMS 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6(A)", 7(A)B1)(C), 8, 9, 11(A), 13, & 14 OF TABLE A
THEREOF. THE FIELD WORK WAS COMPLETED ON DECEMBER 26, 2024.

DATE

COLLIN WOODYARD

PROFESSIONAL SURVEYOR AND MAPPER NO. LS7423

THIS CERTIFICATION IS MADE TO ONLY NAMED PARTIES FOR PURCHASE AND/OR MORTGAGE OF HEREIN DELINEATED
PROPERTY BY THE NAMED PURCHASER. NO RESPONSIBILITY OR LIABILITY IS ASSUMED BY SURVEYOR FOR THE USE OF
SURVEY FOR ANY OTHER PURPOSE INCLUDING, BUT NOT LIMITED TO, USE OF SURVEY AFFIDAVIT, RESALE OF PROPERTY,
OR TO ANY OTHER PERSON NOT LISTED IN CERTIFICATION, EITHER DIRECTLY OR INDIRECTLY.

BOHLER

1900 NW CORPORATE BOULEVARD

FLORIDA BUSINESS CERT. OF AUTH. No. LB#3085

SUITE 101E
BOCA RATON, FLORIDA 33431
Phone:  (561) 571-0280
Fax: (561) 571-0281

20 10 9 40

SCALE: 1" = 40’

SHEET NUMBER:

11b

REVISION 1 - 02/06/2025

DISCLAMER

2
k]
£
&
£
3
2
g

This drawing andior file has been prepared by Bohler at the reques

ihe recipient. Bohler makes no representation regarding the sui

ihe Project Owner o his Representative and is being provided solely as a converien

i
s
i
g
El
g
e
=
2
H
£
g
2
2
5
£
g
3
g
2
g
g
2
&
E
H
g
5
B
2
g
i
H
g
2
2
8

3
3
g
g
E
£
g

i
ue to the alterable nature of electronic document

uthorization from Bohler .

Only curtent,sighed and sealed plans shall be utized for constructon purposes.

. By opening iis file or through fhe use of the information contained herein, the recipient agrees to indemnify and hold Bohler harmless from any loss, damage, liabilty or cost,

the above terms.

ncluding reasonable attorney's fees that Bohler defending such claims, arising from any use or reuse of this electronic document or information.




Planning Department
1700 Convention Center Drive, 2nd Floor

Miamil Beach, Florida 33139, www.miamibeachfl.gov

305.673.7550

COMMERCIAL - ZONING DATA SHEET

ALL INFORMATION REQUIRED BELOW MUST BE SUBMITTED AS REQUESTED. THE FORMAT OF THIS
DOCUMENT MAY NOT BE MODIFIED OR ALTERED IN ANY WAY. SUBMITTALS FOUND INSUFFICIENT OR
INCOMPLETE MAY RESULT IN A FAILED REVIEW

NN L rtel 4
O ICENSE 4
S 9 » =
= ; No. 93403 T =
= * * 5112025 . e =|
E‘ .... .y, - .': zs
A R T
20, . STATEOF . &>
’/,/‘%:s;'-ﬁLole_\ O\e\\\
A TR N
" StonaL B

ITEM - -
. Project Information
1 Address: B50 Commerce Si. Miami Beach, FL 33138 Folio numhe;{s]: 02-4203.009-2100  |Year built:
2 Board file number(s), Determination of Architectural Significance: Lot Area: 021 AC
3 Located within a Local Historic District (Yes or No): Y88 nZOning District: | G-P5a Lot width: 88.52
4 Individual Historic Site (Yes or Noj: No Lot Depth: 2955 17  |Subterrenean, Pedestal & Tower (non-Oceanfront) Required Existing Proposed Deficiencies
5 Base Flood Elevation: 8.00 Grade value in NGVD: 4:98° a |Eront setbacks 0
6 Adjusted grade (BFE+Grade [ 2): 6.49' Free board: E.00+1=5800 b |Side interior setback a
7 Proposed Use: AESTAURANT OR NMIGHT CLUB ¢ |Side facing street setback o)
8 Proposed Accesory Use: N/A d |Rearsetback & i}
Signed and sealed Landscape Plans {Tree/Vegetation Survey, Tree i ir Ci i £ i
9 it : P _ See attached 18  |Minimum Apartment Unit Size Required Existing Proposed Deficiencies
isposition Plan, and [rrigation Plan): 5 2 |New Cordrocion NIA
ZONING INFORMATION / CALCULATION Required Existing Proposed Deficiencies b |Rehabilitated Buildings A
13 Floor Area Ratio (FAR) 1 1,56 ¢ |Hotel Unit A
18 eulding velght bl 2 19 |Average Apartment Unit Size Required Existing Proposed | Deficiencies
15 At grade parking lot on the same lot NiA = |New Canstruction NA
8 |Frontsethacks L b |Rehabilitated Buildings NiA
b [Side interior setback hrA ¢ |Hotel Unit A
¢_[Sice tacing siraet sethack A 20 [Required Open-space ratio (RPS, CPS) NiA
d |Rear setback HA 21 |Parking NiA NiA&
16  |Subterrenean, Pedestal & Tower (non-Oceanfront) Required Existing Proposed Deficiencies 22 |Loading NIA NIA
3 |Front setbacks a
b |Side interior setback a
¢ |Side facing street setback i Motes: Indicate N/A if not applicable.
d |Rear setback 5 5
[ ]
BAI Architecture ZONING DATA J0B 20210138
BOS CcoL LA :
: _ : CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE: 11¢
51SleeperSt. 875 N High St. 360 E 2 St. 850 COMMERCE ST DATE: 05.02.2025
6" Floor Suite 300 Suite 300 _ .
Boston, MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 6 | EE | 05022025 |DRB- FINAL SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EE
617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:




4/30/2025 6:31:32 PM

Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

0.5 MI RADIUS

SITE LOCATION

BAIl Architecture

CONTEXTUAL LOCATION PLAN

JOB #: 20240136
208 got A CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE: 1 1 d
51SleeperSt. 875 NHigh St. 360 E2™ St. 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025
o Fioor Suie 300 Suite 300 890 COMMERCEST 2 | EP |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
Boston, MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 Ll :
617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


JEFFERSON A /VE/VUE
(PALM AVE — PLAT,

pPE 2 FG. 87

L0715

CIRF— ‘ = )
LN (N r e

PN IN) )
477 ‘1\! ~| S con
Lor 14 Lor 13 '
aock Wil 15— |
| Q1 E OF HEF \‘ ?
| — il
| 25" ‘W/
| | ‘ (
L {
S) / e
MY\ BLOCK B - L$
§ B B b (07 17
| : — NN
S | | K
3 . 1
3 | NS
S ¥ 4
A
4 N01°59'57"W(M)/ NS
S | 100.00°(M&P) BAW
S \ | o
% | l/‘\ 0 TH
| N
N \ fb"j\ =
o o

FPL EASEMENT
ORE 29046, PG J142
SONG 15 0.7

NN
SONCN N N
1
S\

=

197

' C/O ORION REAL ESTATE GROUP
O TR FOLIO: 02-4203-009-2100

= ) o
N88°00°03"E(M) (=
90.00'(M&P) .

HLOIM LNGW3AYd X3 282

LOTS 10-12 l
! BLOCK 51 '

P.B. 2, PG. 81
LANDS OF
LIMESTONE PLANT LL

O.R.B. 33193, PG. 2721’

PROP RAMP WITH
HANDRAIL (1:12 MAX)

FFL LASEMENT

orp 28991, F6. 1595
@

11X12.5" FPL FASEMENT
ORB 28585 F6 J956

- COM,

- Xz o

! I&

£

£280" 10 /7-/[ WIERSECTION WITH WASHIVGTON AVENVE.

Lor &

940500

70" WIDE RIGHT—0F—WAY
ASPHALT PAVED PUBLIC KROADWAY
74 B 2 FG 87

MERCE STREET \

[

\\ {/
\\\\\ OEN JA IPI[~ / //,/
. \\CENSg .. 4= 7,
SR
'. 39 No.93403 - % =
=% * 512025 % e =
By ¥ S
”//o ~. STATEOF . &=
2 fes - Ftoriok - ST
%) Sy ‘;0\\\
| ‘s /IONA‘- \\\\
| TN

N\ 47 . A |
| | S 5 REAR SETBACK Z— | |- )
’ SO, PRS- 46" PYE) s [
o et 5'ALLEY
> PROP PRIVACY — @W COKE. N
|| FENCEENCLOSURE _ | PAVED PUBLIC ALLEY 2
e — 4 LA pE 2 PG 87 ]
oh 45;,_1,}; ]
,—588°00°03"W(M)
90.00'(M&P)
WAL & DK IV CONCRETE W/
BAI Architecture SITE PLAN soB# 2040136
508 eot HA CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE: 11h
51 Sleeper St. 875 N High St. 360 E 2 St. 6 ee | 05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025
5" Foor Suie 300 Suite 300 850 COMMERGE ST 2 | EE |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EE
Boston, MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 Rk .
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:




4/30/2025 6:31:33 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

COMMERCE ST

CACTUS CLUB CAFE

S POINTE CT

¥

i S

G4

NOT TO SCALE
PHOTO C: LEFT SIDE OF BUILDING 9/12/2024 PHOTO D: RIGHT SIDE OF BUILDING 9/12/2024 PHOTO E: REAR ALLEYWAY 9/12/2024
BAI Architecture CONTEXTUAL SITE PHOTOS JoB# 20240138
208 oo g CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  1"=40-0" 11i.1
51SleeperSt. 875 NHigh St. 360 E 27 St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
gosFtlc())r(‘n),rMA 02210 gzllfn'nst?fs, OH 43215 fﬁgiiggm CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 | EP ]03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:34 PM

Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

COMMERCE ST
[ V]
N -
CACTUS CLUB CAFE
13
v
S POINTE CT
O
PHOTO A: REAR ALLEYWAY 9112/2024 PHOTO B: MAIN ENTRANCE ON COMMERCE STREET 9/12/2024 NOT TO SCALE
BAI Architecture CONTEXTUAL SITE PHOTOS o8 20pa0138
Bos got HA CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE: 1"=40-0" 1 1 i 2
51SleeperSt. 875 NHigh St. 360 E 27 St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
6" Floor Suite 300 Suite 300 R .
Bost(())r(‘n), MA 02210 cmtqubus,OH 43215 Losti\ngems, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 | EP ]03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:35 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

COMMERCE ST
1 1}
- .
[of < (&
CACTUS CLUB CAFE
13
v
S POINTE CT
1 KEY PLAN
PHOTO F: DINING SPACE 9/12/2024 PHOTO G: DINING SPACE 9/12/2024 NOT TO SCALE
BAIl Architecture CONTEXTUAL INTERIOR PHOTOS 08 20040136
208 ot A CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE: 1" =40-0" 11i 1
51Sleeper St. 875N High St 360 E27St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 J .
gosFtlc())r(‘n),rMA 02210 ii'ffrfffs,m 43215 fﬁgiiggm CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 | EP ]03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:36 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

COMMERCE ST

1 1}
@\A
CACTUS CLUB CAFE /@\
13 ¢
v

S POINTECT
1 KEY PLAN
PHOTO H: EMPLOYEE OFFICE SPACE 91212024 o oro |- BAR SEATING 9/12/2024 NOT TO SCALE
BAIl Architecture CONTEXTUAL INTERIOR PHOTOS 08 20240136
208 got A CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE: 1"=40-0" 1 1 2
51Sleeper St 875 N High St 360 E27St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
gosFtlc())r(‘n),rMA 02210 gzllfr:t?fs,OH 43215 fggiigge& CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 | EP ]03.04.2025 DRB- FIRST SUBMITTAL DWNBY: EP/SC
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:36 PM

Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

2ON

\
@\

COMMERCE ST

CACTUS CLUB CAFE

AN

S POINTE CT
NOT TO SCALE
PHOTO A: BUILDING ON PLAN WEST 9/12/2024 PHOTO B: PARKING LOT ACROSS FROM BUILDING 9/12/2024 PHOTO C: BUILDING ON PLAN EAST 9/12/2024

BAI Architecture CONTEXTUAL EXTERIOR PHOTOS J0B# 20240136

208 oo g CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  1"=40-0" 11k
51 Sleeper St. 875 N High St. 369 E 2" St. 850 COMMERCE ST DATE: 05.02.2025

gosth:,rMA 02210 ii'ffrfffs,m 43215 fﬁgiﬁggm CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 6 | SC ] 05022025 DRB- FINAL SUBMITTAL DWNBY: Author

617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:37 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt
27 27
1 1
? @G ® OO © ? 0Jo ® 66 @
| 498 L 99\, 255" | | I
jFPROPERTYLINE q /fPR_OPERTYLII\fE _ _ o
ST T T , ‘ |
/ ]
=] =K —1; — £ (»)
| o : | | | o |
H ~ B it B | = e B = =
R Il 1 . )
H =5 H I 0 /
N is ‘9 A I M )
| / _ _ | | _ — P
—|m - 7T = - NN - m ® T [ a T ®
| 1] 1 \ for
BAR DINING , [ i
DINING ' [ o
e = Al B —© 1 L _ L —©
— | - - o 7, O) - - - - I YT —']—@
W ‘ = H ] _ _ _ _ _\ / _ E
_°_7_ - - _g - L‘ _/l W H‘ B 5 @ || I \\/ I Q
_g_m [T — F F— ‘J_Ul i E— T ;Eﬁ_® S = — N 7 Tr—rr——F _/ [ _/ \ _'ﬁ[ @
[ D N\ N \T | L ] N // i / \ 7
Al 85-9" y s 19-10" N / [t // \\ I
N %_? . _ _ — |4 _ _ @ — — — < - = — |t — —4 @
= A | I p | osomce 4L 1
| *RESTROOMS- KITCHEN N i / \
OFFICE . . AN / \
n Q][O ] = ﬁ “ EY;P / g \\ E / \
e In _ _ _ 4 — e — — — H
T, . ®) (T T e BN / T ®

LT T T

I I T s N / vl
UTILITIES —— =L ' ] 7 h Il Vi
(1] = | - BACK 4 Sl e BACK
TRASH oL I @’T o I = T P T NSETBACK L A — SETBACK
l / :‘; ' LlNE 5"0" | | | | LlNE 5"0"
N IR i = | . . | | | i - T e

N 171" L LT _443 _______ I 562_ I .« PROPERTY ~=— PROPERTY
- 7 - S PE— ) E— - LINE - - - - —_ - — - — 21 |INE
1 EXISTING CONDITIONS PLAN - FIRST FLOOR 9 EXISTING CONDITIONS PLAN - MEZZANINE

1/16" = 1'-0" 1/16" = 1'-0"
BAI Architecture EXISTING CONDITIONS PLAN - FIRST FLOOR / MEZZ. Jobt aomionss
208 oo A CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  1/16"=1-0" 111.1
51SleeperSt. 875 N High St. 360 E 27 St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
Boston MA02210 ol OH 43215 Los Asgeles, GA 80012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 | EP |03.042025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:37 PM

Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

ROOF e
+24|_0|l

EXISTING STUCCO
EXISTING SKYLIGHTS TO REMAIN
IS | | /LOWER ROOF ;!
g | I | ! " qn
EXISTING WHITE SIDING I I i I ! I T_I_‘L4[I/ 9
R ’ — EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN
T =1
1 ajnin LT
| | 7 FINISH FLOOR
I I I I +0-0" (+4.98'NGVD)@
) 2510" AEE 498" |
4 7 7
EXISTING BLACK FABRIC AWNING
1 EXISTING SOUTH ELEVATION
3/32" =1'-Q"
@ ® ® ® O roor
EXISTING PAINTED STUCCO AND PAINTED 240"
BLOCK FACADE - . EXISTING ROOFING TO REMAIN
| ‘ . LOWER ROOF
° ' +19-1" e
\\ i ~a I
EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN
EXISTING PIPES TO REMAIN —=_ | 5 = | STING WINDOWS TO
= \ - EXISTING WHITE SIDING
EXISTING GARAGE DOOR TO REMAIN —— - S— | i ! EXISTING ELECTRICAL MAINS
. — | D D] AND METERS TO REMAIN
A\ i | H H H H H H H EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN
| | = FINISH FLOOR @
] o1 0 | +0-0" (+4.98' NGVD)
7 |
9 EXISTING NORTH ELEVATION

3/32" =1'-0"

EXISTING CONDITIONS ELEVATIONS

BAI Architecture

BOS coL L

51 Sleeper St. 875 N High St. 360 E2M St.
6" Floor Suite 300 Suite 300
Boston, MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012

617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090

CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH

850 COMMERCE ST
MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139

JOB #: 20240136
SCALE: 3/32"=1-0" 1 1 | 2
6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
2 | EP |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:38 PM

EXISTING ROOFING TO REMAIN

Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

EXISTING SKYLIGHTS TO REMAIN

EXISTING PAINTED STUCCO AND ROOF
PAINTED BLOCK FACADE —@Q T
: _ LOWER ROOF
EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN —— | 1l — — - - — = — === 191" e
E%\T‘;; = | | m ’i‘ | E +
EXISTING WHITE SIDING — | — | - N D D LI L [ 208"
- - - - L | L I - v
I | T L ~— EXISTING BLACK FABRIC AWNING
’ % — 1 — — ! | 0 - EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN
Hin - o o LS
(I— L | — | —
a FINISH FLOOR @
Ces | s 606" Corr |72 +0-0" (+4.98' NGVD)0-0"
7 /7 /7 /7
EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN
' EXISTING EAST ELEVATION
3/32" =1'-0"
EXISTING ROOFING TO REMAIN
EXISTING WHITE SIDING ® ® O ® ® © ®) ROOF
240" e
EXISTING SKY LIGHTS '
| ! . LOWER ROOF
I~ . +19-1" e
EXISTING BLACK FABRIC AWNING = - | — L i
) S— EXISTING PAINTED STUCCO AND
\ | PAINTED BLOCK FACADE
[
EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN - |
' ' FINISH FLOOR @
| 90-0" | 00" (498'NGVD)
4 4
EXISTING WEST ELEVATION
2 amr =t

BAI Architecture

BOS coL L

51 Sleeper St. 875 N High St. 360 E2M St.
6" Floor Suite 300 Suite 300
Boston, MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012

617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090

EXISTING CONDITIONS ELEVATIONS

CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH

850 COMMERCE ST
MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139

JOB #: 20240136
SCALE: 3/32"=1-0" 1 1 | 3
6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
2 | EP |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:38 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

®E ® OB

@

%PR_OPERTY LIl\fE | o ) ] e . [PR_OPERTY LII\{E
=Tl e F =17 [ ] 7
e _ _ _ _ _L @
e ™ @ ® @ ®® @
| : | | | : : [FEE“__ N SIS S S
] I I L
- S| Il - | I fl
- 4 — @ e = —— i —®
| . | | | 1 1T
| I
— = | | L |
E=Eg == _ © _ ] _ _ 5 _ P
Iy \}_ﬁ il _Tl_T _ — @ 1 _ _ _ _ _ - —®
1 T T e | B 1 ® B B B L B 1] ®
e I T ] | [ M
U S N e | v ] | (F) L _ _ _ _ —_—— a5
L i T T T | i 1‘
i B[ S .
i - i h %“
I E == | _ _ _ _ @ 1 o o _ I @
saEe Al - i 1
%iﬂfjiﬂh:—l n | 7|
!l L I I
Loalls_gl=8 S—=r=mrF _ 1| _ B L |
TEIE | T IT® i IH - T N H—®
\—|_ _,:U —l [— I | I | I H ‘ 4 | '
|| I Iﬁ% E{ | [ j f
" e | g - - BACK | . i I BACK
/r I ! I I I = SETBACK | ! o] o - [ SETBACK
L / LINE 5'-0" / LINE 5'-0"
L e ~=— PROPERTY - R o _-‘ ________ ~=— PROPERTY
. . . - - - A1 |INE 21" LINE
1 DEMOLITION PLAN - FIRST FLOOR 9 DEMOLITION PLAN - MEZZANINE
116" = 10" 116" = 10"
BAIl Architecture DEMOLITION PLAN - FIRST FLOOR / MEZZ. Joor 20m0m56
Bos got tA CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  1/16"=1-0" 1 1 m 1
51SleeperSt. 875 N High St. 360 E 27 St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
omton MAO2210 Ot OH 43215 Lo pooules, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 | EP |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.332.109'0 ' NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:39 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

@

DEMOLISH PORTION OF EXTERIOR

|
FACADE TO RECEIVE NEW DOOR TEATET ‘
Hﬁu; SR
S| |

() ROOF é
+24|_0|l

| LOWER ROOF e
| +19-1"

EXISTING WINDOWS TO BE REMOVED

DEMOLITION SOUTH ELEVATION

[ FINISH FLOOR @
| +0-0" (+4.98' NGVD)

| | REMOVE EXISTING DOOR AND PORTION OF
H EXTERIOR FACADE TO BE IN LINE WITH TOP OF
| GLAZING DATUM
LT

3/32" =1'-0"

@ @ ©

EXISTING DOOR TO BE RAISED 6" TO BE
FLUSH WITH INTERIOR FINISH FLOOR.

© ROOF é
+24|_0|l

LOWER ROOF e
+19|_1|l

EXISTING DOOR TO BE RAISED 8" TO BE
FLUSH WITH INTERIOR FINISH FLOOR.

] ==
| L ! FINISH FLOOR
f y +0'-0" (+4.98'NGVD)@
9 DEMOLITION NORTH ELEVATION
332" = 10"

BAIl Architecture DEMOLITION ELEVATIONS s08#: 20040136
208 got A CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  3/32"=1-0" 1 1 m 2
51SleeperSt. 875 NHigh St. 360 E 27 St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
gosFtlc(J):,rMA 02210 izlLer:k?L?s,OH 43215 fglsti\igges, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 | EP ]03.04.2025 DRB- FIRST SUBMITTAL DWNBY: EP/SC
617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:40 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

ROOF
+240" e

Jii 1nr ~ 0 e g

1 = |
3 — - - E_ﬂ ) 19-1
|

= = - = S
A - H I HHHH—E

FINISH FLOOR @
+0-0" (+4.98'NGVD)

DEMOLITION EAST ELEVATION

1 mr=1o
0 (®) o ® ® © W) ~00F
: | . . . LOWERROOF;B
] | — #1914
[ I I ] L
[ ]
I | | | FINISH FLOOR @
‘ +0-0" (+4.98' NGVD)
9 DEMOLITION WEST ELEVATION
3/32"=1"-0"
BAI Architecture DEMOLITION ELEVATIONS o8 a0pa0138
Bos got HA CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  3/32"=1-0" 1 1 m 3
51SleeperSt. 875 NHigh St 360 E 2 St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
gosFtloo:,rMA 02210 ii'frfffs, OH 43215 fﬁgiiggm CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 | EP ]03.04.2025 DRB- FIRST SUBMITTAL DWNBY: EP/SC
617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:42 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

1ST FLOOR: 6,890 SF

TRASH ENCLOSURE: 166 SF
EXISTING PATIO: 300 SF
@ @ @ @ EXISTING (BOH) MEZZANINE: 779 SF
NEW (DINING) MEZZANINE: 849 SF

PROPERTY LINE |
Ti _ _ [
|

TOTAL SF: 8,984

PROPERTY LINE
- —_— - — - - - - - - INTERIOR SEATS: 210
EXTERIOR SEATS: 16
@ @ @ @ @ @ ‘ SEATING IN PUBLIC WAY: NONE

TOTAL SEATS: 226

‘ S = ‘ INTERIOR OCCUPANT LOAD: 410
| L " K EXTERIOR OCCUPANT LOAD: 16
\
_ _ _ | 1] G- " 7/ ®) TOTAL OCCUPANT LOAD: 426
; = I \ J/ TOTAL NUMBER OF PROPOSED SEATS
. " MAINBAR : N . IS 226, WHICH ACCOUNTS FOR ACTUAL
m:ﬁjﬁam—ﬁ | OPENTO SEATS. THE TOTAL OCCUPANT LOAD IS
] 426, WHICH IS CALCULATED BASED ON
e E BELOW 1l L—(c) | DESIGN LOAD FACTORS INCLUDING 18"
. — — — — — — 5 el OF BANQUETTE SEATING PER PERMIT
; VAV (® - - - T ) = ~ (D) | COMMENTS RECEIVED FROM FIRE
/ N PROTECTION. SEE "05-02-25 PLANNING
+— H—rDINING ROOMB— {1 |—(E) ! — I — — + +4 — — (E) | RESPONSE COMMENT" FOR
SERVICE AREA ESES [ 232 N |1 ADDITIONAL CONTEXT ON SEAT COUNT
— e = —(F) I E— o — e a4 Sc—(F) | VS OCCUPANT LOAD CALCULATION
— gg T T~ % S0SR08S APPROVED BY PLANNING.
s ya
RESTROOM T \E - : N e
| 1AREA affl | o — ik N0 s L NN A ‘@ '
e =~ WL L —lF=—r 4 (6 —EMECHANCAL aFF T — U Rl | T ©
i1 9 \ o 1 STORAGE || N e | B |
e \E gg — , SPENTO 1 MEZZANINE ;
= | N . H}]\ P = BELOW | DINING 9
S i = > _@_ﬂ : : —— _ . N 2 " : | H
{8 =y Craff|—® T ~ < é &2 —®
UTILITIES : = . MANAGERS » i /7 AN i I
[ EMPLOYEE OFFICE , N § @%ﬁ
= =3 FHW AREA BACK MSTORAGE - N : L
[EONDITIONED% . ~ SETBACK -‘;‘l L ——— ;lg i u{ F' B I':ACK
TRASH I 4 '/ LINE5-0" mpnE ] O | /SETBACK
| / o |
I _ L _a'):\ I T _/ [N E— ) e L 4y — — — — — !—L|NE5'-0"
1 @—/ SN ~— PROPERTY
- - L e - - ‘ - - 44 LINE - - - - - -
PROPERTY
1 PROPOSED FLOOR PLAN - FIRST FLOOR 9 PROPOSED FLOOR PLAN - MEZZANINE LINE
1/16" =1'-0" 1/16" =1'-0"
BAIl Architecture PROPOSED FLOOR PLAN - FIRST FLOOR / MEZZ. .
pos oo A CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  Asindicated 11n.1
51SleeperSt. 875 N High St. 360 E 27 St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
Boston MAG2210 Columbus, OF 43215 Los Angeles CA 80012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2_| EP 103042025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:43 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

/7 PROPERTY LINE / FRONT & SIDE SET BACK LINE (0' FROM PROPERTY LINE)

"/J m U O O [I_Il O O [I_F

|
~- 1 ~ EXISTING EXTERIOR PATIO & STEPS TO REMAIN

—+—— PROPERTY LINE/ SIDE SET BACK LINE (0'
FROM PROPERTY LINE)

—— NEW OPERABLE NANAWALL SL73 (HURRICANE
GRADE/FLORIDA APPROVED PRODUCT)

DINING ROOM A

TP LI

PROPOSED FLOOR PLAN - ENLARGED FRONT EXTERIOR

— — — —  — &

2 1/8" - 1I_O|l
UTILITIES | ’ | .
KITCHEN |  EMPLOYEE -« SIDE SETBACK LINE 0' FROM PROPERTY LINE
- o AREA |
L rl ! !——; NEW ACCESSIBLE RAMP WITH DOOR ACTUATORS
CONDITIONED ! ﬂ ﬂ ﬂ ﬂ | _ REAR SETBACK LINE 5-0" FROM PROPERTY LINE
TRASH ) "
ul =c.> /
—_—— _——— b - e
. \\ ; PROPERTY LINE
\< \
366" EXISTING STORM SEWER COVER ON REAR 7' TALL EQUIPMENT ENCLOSURE WITH PROPER
SET BACK LINE CLEARANCES TO NEW & EXISTING PIPES AND
1 PROPOSED FLOOR PLAN - ENLARGED REAR EXTERIO EQUIPMENT MAINTAINED. ENCLOSURE HEIGHT IS
1/8" = 1'-0" COMPLAINT WITH ZONING REGULATIONS
BAl Architecture PROPOSED FLOOR PLAN - ENLARGED EXTERIOR o8t 20240136
Bos eot tA CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  1/8"=1-0° 1 1 n 2
5(1h Sleeper St. 87.5 N High St. 369 E2MSt. 850 COMMERCE ST DATE: 05.02.2025 "
oston MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Lot Ageles, CA 80012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 6 | SC | 05022025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DWN BY: sC
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:44 PM

| |
PROPERTY LINE
.

Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

ﬁj@ S —

®

! | | |
NN P\

p

== |

4

4

-

-

T LI L

KEYNOTES

(1) EXISTING ERV TO REMAIN

(2) EXISTING RTU TO REMAIN

(3) PROPOSED KEF

(4) EXISTING CU TO REMAIN

(5) PROPOSED CU

EXISTING EMERGENCY GENERATOR TO
REMAIN

@ EXISTING DOAS TO BE REPLACED BY
NEW DOAS

Q EXISTING OUTSIDE AIR ROOF CAP TO
REMAIN

PROPOSED OUTSIDE AIR INTAKE WITH
ROOF CAP AND GRAVITY DAMPER

EXISTING SKYLIGHT TO REMAIN

REPLACE EXISTING BLACK FABRIC ON

ENTRY CANOPY WITH YELLOW FABRIC
ON SIDES AND TOP WITH NEW CANVAS
MURAL ON UNDERSIDE

| = . TR 8
@ f[_g
4 |
— 9 e
S _ | = _ _ I
| S | |
4317
@ |, |
I N _ _ _ M- — = |
S |
oni Al
- = e SO | BACK
—£ : : - SETBACK
| | ) UNese
T _‘ ____________________ < PROPERTY
. . L = - — " LINE
1 ROOF PLAN
116" =1'-0"
BAIl Architecture PROPOSED ROOF PLAN soB#: 20040136
208 got A CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  Asindicated 1 1 N 3
51SleeperSt. 875 NHigh St 360 E27St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
gosFtlc(J):,rMA 02210 izlLer:k?L?s,OH 43215 Eglsti\:ggms, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 | EP ]03.04.2025 DRB- FIRST SUBMITTAL DWNBY: EP/SC
617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:46 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

@ 5 © @ @
<;> ROOF
— NEWFAUXWOOD 1 METAL CHANNEL LETTERS WITH FACELIT WHITE PLEXIGASS . MIN. 2" —+240¢

PLANKING OVER DEPTH. TOTAL AREA: 60.71 SF. TOTAL ALLOWABLE AREA: 85' 6" |
EXISTING ROOFING TO REMAIN / -— | EXISTING STUCCO (TOTAL LINEAR FRONTAGE) X 0.75= 64.125 SF EXISTING SKYLIGHTS TO REMAIN
EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN = ' | —=
e —— | | | I F_% NEW BLACK FLASHING CAP
EXISTING WHITE SIDING TO BE .H] I I I I I” i T L - -
REPAINTED GREY B GRS T AT TIB . A A ;
|| ( : , EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN
NEW 14'-0" W X 70" H OPERABLE ! [ ] B
METALAND GLASS NANAWALL ||| i i MEZZANINE
\E\ R &l H +9-0"
INFILL WALL AT DEMOLISHED R Ei= | ~i— - NEWFIXED WINDOW TO MATCH ADJACENT
WINDOWS. WALL ASSEMBLY TO = =] . i i EXISTING WINDOWS IN PLACE OF EXISTING DOOR
MATCH EXISTING HH | &S {
| 8 ; ; ~ L N LEVEL 1 @
N 85-6" | | 1 +0-0" (+4.98 NGVD)
P4
EXISTING DOOR AND SIDELITES TOTAL LINEAR FRONTAGE ‘ ‘ INFILL WALL AT DEMOLISHED DOOR. WALL ASSEMBLY
TO REMAIN TO MATCH EXISTING
REPLACE EXISTING BLACK FABRIC ON ENTRY CANOPY WITH
YELLOW FABRIC ON SIDES AND TOP WITH NEW CANVAS NEW FAUX WOOD PLANKING OVER EXISTING STUCCO
1 PROPOSED NORTH ELEVATION MURAL ON UNDERSIDE
332" = 10"
O @ ® (@) ®
ROOF
EXISTING PAINTED STUCCO AND PAINTED Eé'SRTE"\"A‘El SCUPPERS — 240" %
BLOCK FACADE TO BE CLEANED, FINISHES | | EXISTING ROOFING TO REMAIN
TO REMAIN | |
[ T[] [ 1 I L i F [ u
EXISTING LIGHTING ABOVE DOORS TO )
REMAIN, TYPICAL ATBOTHREAR < ~a \ EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN
DOORS. ) \ ) |
| EXISTING FACADE REPAINTED GREY
| I | MEZZANINE
EXISTING GARAGE DOOR TO REMAIN — .( 1 R = ° | 190" @
< , T s I B e A , FF]
EXISTING GAS UTILITY PROTECTED i o . 2 = : A — 4| HIRIE EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN
BY BOLLARDS TO REMAIN IN EXISTING - (] R
LOCATION ' | PR SN A S UL Wl LEVEL 1 e
| L 36-9" , +0-0" (+4.98 NGVD)
EXISTING DOOR TO BE RAISED 6" TO BE FLUSH WITH INTERIOR 7 7
FINISH FLOOR. ENTRY IS NOT BEING USED AS AN ACCESSIBLE - NEW FAUX WOOD CLAD EQUIPMENT ENCLOSURE, EXISTING DOOR TO BE RAISED 8" TO BE FLUSH WITH INTERIOR FINISH FLOOR. ENTRY IS BEING
ENTRY OR EXIT. DOOR TO BE USED FOR LOADING ONLY. FINISH TO MATCH ADJACENT GREY FACADE USED AS AN ACCESSIBLE MEANS OF EGRESS. NEW EXTERIOR ADA COMPLIANT RAMP &
RAILING PROPOSED WITHIN PROPERTY LINE.
EXISTING ELECTRICAL MAINS AND METERS
PROPOSED SOUTH ELEVATION PR
2 famr=to
BA' Arch:tectu re PROPOSED ELEVATIONS JOB#: 20240136
B80S cox CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  3/32"=1-0" 1 1 0 1
51SleeperSt. 875 N High St. 360 E 27 St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
6™ Floor Suite 300 Suite 300 _ .
Bost((JJ:, MA 02210 Colfmbus, OH 43215 Losi\ngeles, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 | EP |03.04.2025 |DRB- FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY- EP/SC
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:48 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

@ @ @ QG G @ EXISTING SKYLIGHTS TO REMAIN

NEW BLACK FLASHING CAP
EXISTING ROOFING TO REMAIN
EXISTING PAINTED STUCCO AND , || ROOF
PAINTED BLOCK FACADE TO BE | —@+24._0..
CLEANED, FINISHES TO REMAIN
NEW FAUX WOOD PLANKING OVER EXISTING
EXISTING WINDOWS TOREMAIN —— — =X | : / STUCCO
N\ — E— — — — —
Exzqﬂﬂﬂ = EEN EEIlININ = REPLACE EXISTING BLACK FABRIC WITH YELLOW
EXISTING WHITE SIDING TO BE Y — — [ ] “ FABRIC ON SIDES AND TOP WITH NEW CANVAS
REPAINTED GREY — | [ ] = D =1 | / MURAL ON UNDERSIDE
8!_0" 4 L — L L H
NEW FAUX WOOD EQUIPMENT i ‘ : o P MEZZANINE
ENCLOSURE WITHFINISHESTO~~ —, i +9-0" e
MATCH ADJACENT GREY FACADE - ] = u = Exminln L STING WINDOVIS 70 RELAIN
EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN _ & | - — : J
R~ —
- — - - LEVEL 1
- +00" (+4.98'NGVD) 65
NEW EXTERIOR RAMP & RAILING
PROPOSED WITHIN PROPERTY LINE. EXISTING PILLARS TO BE REPAINTED GREY
EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN
1 mr=to
® ©©) ®
EXISTING ROOFING TO REMAIN
EXISTING WHITE SIDING REPRAINTED GREY STING ROOFING TO
EXISTING SKY LIGHTS TO REMAIN
NEW FAUX WOOD PLANKING OVER EXISTING | - ROOF
STUCCO | +240
\ =~ EXISTING PAINTED STUCCO AND PAINTED
NEW BLACK FLASHING CAP \ }J% W—AL | - : | . ' / BLOCK FACADE TO BE CLEANED, FINISHES TO
REPLACE EXISTING BLACK FABRIC WITH S : oo ; - REMAIN
YELLOW FABRIC ON SIDES AND TOP WITH — | I
NEW CANVAS MURAL ON UNDERSIDE \ I
[ i ) MEZZANINE i!
E +9|_0ll
EXISTING WINDOWS TO REMAIN - RN i
Hi u
LEVEL 1 @
| +0'0" (+4.98'NGVD)
2 st
BAI Architecture PROPOSED ELEVATIONS JOB#: 20240136
2o o g CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  3/32'=1-0" 110.2
51SleeperSt. 875 N High St. 360 E 27 St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
6™ Floor Suite 300 Suite 300 .
Bost((JJ:, MA 02210 Colfmbus, OH 43215 Losi\ngeles, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 | EP |03.04.2025 |DRB- FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY- EP/SC
617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


@ PAINT @ HISTORICAL @ EXTERIOR FAUX @ YELLOW SUNBRELLA
BUILDING AND WOOD - KNOT WOOD FABRIC @ CANOPY
STUCCO WALLS AT @ RESTAURANT AND UMBRELLAS
SIDEWALK FACADE

¢ @ PAINT TO MATCH THE @ PAINT @ CANOPY @ BARRON HOLLAND ART
WOOD @ EXISTING STRUCTURE AND @ UNDER CANOPY
LOW FENCE TRIMS

@ RECESSED SCONCE @ HISTORICAL BUILDING AND STUCCO WALLS AT
SIDEWALK. NOTE STUCCO WALLS AT SIDEWALK HAS 3/4" DEEP NICHE.
OUTER EDGE OF SCONCE ALIGNS WITH OUTER EDGE OF WALLS.

BAIl Architecture EXTERIOR MATERIALS JoB# 20240138

2o o N CACTUS CLUB MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  8/32=1-0" 110 3
51 Sleeper St. 875 N High St. 360 E2ndSt. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
gtc:s':tlgr?,rMA 02210 giilt:r:t?t?s, OH 43215 fgistiigges, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 EP |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC

617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


EXISTING METAL

EXISTING DEAD

PALM TREE TO BE ROOF TO REMAIN NEW BLACK
REMOVED FLASHING CAP
A A
,  EXISTING LARGE
i) FAN PALMS TO BE
R REMOVED
0 EXISTING EGRESS
> - . DOOR REMOVED
) - \ EXISTING
LANDSCAPE
> < » HEIGHT TO BE
ADJUSTED
\ \ 4 Y Y Y
REPLACE
NEW 180" X 70" HIGH EXISTIN REPLACE SCONCES NEW FAUXWOOD  METAL CHANNEL EXISTING FENCE NEW EXISTING
STING PAINTED  PILLARS EXISTING
OPERABLE METALAND WHITE SIDEIN EXISTING BLACK THROUGHOUT ~ PLANKING LETTERS WITH PAINTED
S G FABRIC WITH EACELIT WHITE METAL TOBE TILE ON PIERS
GLASS NANAWALL REPAINTED GRAY /27 0 oo GATE PAINTED TO WOOD
PLEXI PLANKING
ON SIDES AND GRAY
TOP WITH NEW
CANVAS MURAL ON
UNDERSIDE
BA| Archltectu re EXTERIOR - FRONT ELEVATION RENDERING JoB# 20240136
cot HA CACTUS CLUB MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  3/32"=1-0 1 1 q 1
875 N High St. 360E 27 St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
Boston, MA 02210 (S:Lgltjr:t?l?s, OH 43215 fcu,'stiigzes, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 EP | 03.04.2025 | DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


EXISTING PAINTED STUCCO AND
PAINTED BLOCK FACADE TOBE _

EXISTING LIGHTING ABOVE DOORS TO

REMAIN, TYPICAL AT BOTH REAR DOORS.
EXISTING LIGHTING ABOVE

CLEANED, FINISHES TOREMAIN

EXISTING GAS
UTILITY PROTECTED v
BY BOLLARDS TO
REMAIN IN EXISTING
LOCATION

EXISTING GARAGE

Y

DOOR TO REMAIN = Y

EXISTING DOOR TO BE RAISED 6” TO BE FLUSH WITH INTERIOR
FINISH FLOOR. ENTRY IS NOT BEING USED AS AN ACCESSIBLE \
ENTRY OR EXIT. DOOR TO BE USED FOR LOADING ONLY.

‘SOORS TO REMOVE, TYPICAL
AT BOTH REAR DOORS

\ \

EXISTING ELECTRICAL

EXISTING SCUPPERS TO REMAIN

A

EXISTING
A

SCUPPERS TO REMAIN

NEW 7°-0" TALL FAUX WOOD CLAD ENCLOSURE

MAINS AND METERS TO REMAIN

_ EXISTING ROOF TO
" REMAIN

A
A

> EXISTING WINDOWS
TO REMAIN

A

, EXISTING FACADE
REPAINTED GREY

A

> EXISTING WINDOWS
TO REMAIN

A

EXISTING DOOR TO BE RAISED 8” TO BE FLUSH WITH INTERIOR FINISH
FLOOR. ENTRY IS BEING USED AS AN ACCESSIBLE MEANS OF EGRESS.
NEW INTERIOR RAMP & RAILING PROPOSED WITHIN PROPERTY LINE.

BAI Architecture

BOS coL LA

51 Sleeper St. 875 N High St. 360 E2nd St.

6t Floor Suite 300 Suite 300

Boston, MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090

EXTERIOR - REAR ELEVATION RENDERING

CACTUS CLUB MIAMI BEACH

850 COMMERCE ST
MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139

JOB #: 20240136

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0" 1 1 2
6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 q .
2 | EP |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC

BY

DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


BAI Architeptu re

BOS coL L
51 Sleeper St. 875 N High St. 360 E2nd St.
6t Floor Suite 300 Suite 300

Boston, MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090

EXTERIOR - VIEW 1 DAY

CACTUS CLUB MIAMI BEACH

850 COMMERCE ST
MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139

JOB #: 20240136

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0"

6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025

2 | EP |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


BAI Architeptu re

BOS coL L
51 Sleeper St. 875 N High St. 360 E2nd St.
6t Floor Suite 300 Suite 300

Boston, MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090

EXTERIOR - VIEW 1 NIGHT

CACTUS CLUB MIAMI BEACH

850 COMMERCE ST
MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139

JOB #: 20240136

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0"

6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025

2 | EP |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


BAI Architeptu re

BOS coL L
51 Sleeper St. 875 N High St. 360 E2nd St.
6t Floor Suite 300 Suite 300

Boston, MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090

EXTERIOR - VIEW 2 DAY

CACTUS CLUB MIAMI BEACH

850 COMMERCE ST
MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139

JOB#: 20240136

SCALE: 3/32"=1'-0"

6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025

2 | EP |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


BAI Architeptu re

BOS coL L
51 Sleeper St. 875 N High St. 360 E2nd St.
6t Floor Suite 300 Suite 300

Boston, MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090

EXTERIOR - VIEW 2 NIGHT

CACTUS CLUB MIAMI BEACH

850 COMMERCE ST
MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139

JOB #: 20240136

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0"

6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025

2 | EP |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


2/3/2025 1:52:32 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/0136-CactusClubCafe_SouthBeachMiami-24.rvt

EXIST. OAK LEGEND
TO REMAIN L — N
COMMERCE STREET ooy e /)
[ 90.00(mePp) — \ °
PadineN _ i — ,/ " — ;“ — \ WS N # /
A [] 7\\ 3 ‘F | — , | e | \ 7 ]/‘rﬂ; \; -~ |
\\ _ / ‘ \ \ / N _ 7 EXISTING TREE
5 AN — TO REMAIN
- 2 a4y | *re A '
— T A \ / N A LA T — [ -
| 51/ © i I» Ve
=) N raas S n N A
=g AN X \
‘ = e = 7 N \ \
| pa\) [ emh NN o NG
I ;i\ _ EXIST. DATE -
| f PAIMTO | EXISTING TREE TO
= A
r N 1 S S REMAIN ‘ BE REMOVED ORIPLINE
N /: N EOFFSlTE) ,
‘ / e | \ I PIPE 2" O.D. GALVANIZED STEEL
] A
|- . ; I /[ 4o 57 \ ﬁ N .
‘ | - - il
TO BE REMOVED \ / | Ot e s sssasatad
‘ RILRIILIKIKILIILIIETY IRHILRILRIIRIELRI
! \ / ! L | BRI RSP
-~ BUSTING PAL Wl e e | R
\ A2V / \ TO REMAIN VTN %20 0% %o o ete % otetetetotety 53  Sotetotetotetototetototetetetsy
) \ s R assssy
> o - RRERLLLLLLLLLLLLILH [RXXILRLLILLLLLKA
A R BRI
N | J 4 [RILRLLLRLLLRLLPL] RIXLZRILLRILLRRLN
20"
. s N 10-0"
: MAX.
J/ N\ DEPTH
—2 == ] - N | =
R ! - ‘:‘ TrI= ‘F - A | NOTES:
0’57 wW(m) L s o = ./ | "BARRIER SHALL BE PLACED AT THE EDGE OF THE DRIPLINE OF THE THE TREE CANOPY OR AS FAR FROM
) y — f A %7 - 801 °5£ THE TREE AS POSSIBLE WHERE THE CANOPY OVERHANGS PAVEMENT THAT IS TO REMAIN. BARRIER SHALL
-00 (M&P) - \ ™\ T BE MAINTAINED IN AN UPRIGHT POSITION AT ALL TIMES.
": — /‘ 100. 00 -TREE PROTECTION FENCE (TPF) SHALL BE INSTALLED PRIOR TO ANY SITE WORK, CLEARING, OR
. 7 4 DEMOLITION. AND MAINTAINED THROUGHOUT CONSTRUCTION.
B — F - ﬂ -REMOVE TPF ONLY WITH APPROVAL FROM URBAN FORESTER AFTER ALL SITE WORK HAS BEEN
: — _— - — — COMPLETED.
H \\ - ) *NOTE: Should any existing trees or palms be damaged they shall be evaluated by the City Urban Forester to
N ! determine corrective actions that may include removal, corrective pruning and or replacement. Any corrective
I I y p ] P Y
\_!W / | } | actions required shall be performed in accordance with the City of Miami Beach Code, the most current ANSI
A-300 Pruning Standards and or an issued City Tree or Environmental Permit. Any corrective pruning required
|| shall be performed by an ISA Certified Arborist and the City Urban Forester shall be consulted.
0 | - \"
el |
f |
| ~ U TREE PROTECTION DETAIL
N
[//Mﬁfz +
o o o LSS g
Ken Gardner FL LA #1569
® Kiehl Semler ~ FL LA #6667205
RX
o L o o GARDNER + SEMLER
I LANDSCAPE ARCHITECTURE
s EXISTING TREE DISPOSITION PLAN -
= kel
w w N Wl m S |I_G N
—— 77:\ T — 64' - 32' 16' 0 17670 NW 78th AVE., SUITE 214
‘ [ ““ y “ w Wy Ps0s.992 014 F 3050921015
i Wi, | B CORP ID#0000266
& M " | cnlol W A SCAILE:1/16" = 1'-Q"
L]
EXISTING TREE DISPOSITION PLAN ,
renitecuure JOB# 20240136
BOS coL LA SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0"
- - ) CACTUS CLUB MIAMI BEACH 12 1
51 Sleeper St. 875 N High St. 360 E 2 St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | rRx |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025 .
6™ Floor Suite 300 Suite 300 2 03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY:
Boston, MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 RX — RX
617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:




2/3/2025 1:52:32 PM

Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/0136-CactusClubCafe_SouthBeachMiami-24.rvt

Ken Gardner FLLA #1569
Kiehl Semler  FL LA #6667205

GARDNER + SEMLER
I LANDSCAPE ARCHITECTURE

i WWW.GSLADESIGN.COM
;:s:

AN
S I G N

17670 NW 78th AVE., SUITE 214
MIAMI, FL 33015
P 305.392.1016 F 305.392.1019
CORP ID#000026¢6

BAI Architeptu re

BOS coL L

51 Sleeper St. 875 N High St. 360 E 2 St.

6t Floor Suite 300 Suite 300

Boston, MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090

EXISTING TREE DISPOSITION LIST

CACTUS CLUB MIAMI BEACH

850 COMMERCE ST
MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139

JOB #:

20240136

SCALE: 3/32"=1"-0"

6 | rx |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025
2 | rx |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: RX
NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:




4/30/2025 6:31:49 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

-
[T T T T I I T T [T T T T I T T T
| |
- — e :
x = E 7 §7
834 COMMERCE STREET 7-6" ALLEY 850 COMMERCE STREET 2'6"ALLEY 864 & 868 COMMERCE STREET
1 CONTEXTUAL NORTH ELEVATION
1/32" =1"-0"
L
N o —r—— Eg
& B OB
N = i — BE
1 L = 4
4'-1ﬁLEY PAVED PUBLIC ALLEY 7-6" ALLEY
CONTEXTUAL SOUTH ELEVATION
2 n 1 n
1/32" =1'-0
BAI Architecture CONTEXTUAL ELEVATION LINE DRAWINGS obr o
Pos o A CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  1/32" = 10" 18
51 Sleeper St 875 N High St. 360 E2"St. 850 COMMERCE ST 6 | SC |05.02.2025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025
gosFtlc(J):,rMA 02210 ﬁiﬁfffs,m 43215 fggiigge& CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 2 | EP ]03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EP/SC
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


4/30/2025 6:31:50 PM Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

——— METAL CHANNEL LETTERS WITH FACELIT WHITE PLEXIGASS . MIN. 2" RO'Of
DEPTH. TOTAL AREA: 60.71 SF. TOTAL ALLOWABLE AREA: 85' 6" +24'0
| | (TOTAL LINEAR FRONTAGE) X 0.75= 64.125 SF '
| | |

i [ L
§ | | I
|- . [ - B I | 1 T ]
HINIR IR NN INnn CACTUS C S CAFE |
o 1 E MEZZANINE
HH i t +9'-o"¢
— F3 T i in
—— e H oS
= 1 Ed e : !
] ; : : LEVEL 1 @
Y l | 856" ' ' lL +0-0" (+4.98 NGVD)
g I TOTAL LINEAR FRONTAGE ‘ ‘
1 EXTERIOR SIGNAGE
1/8"= 10"
BAI Architectu re SCHEMATIC SIGNAGE PROGRAM JOB¥ 20240136
Pos o A CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  1/8"'=1-0" 27
5(1h Sleeper St. 87.5 N High St. 369 E 2" St. 850 COMMERCE ST DATE: 05.02.2025
gosFtlc(J):,rMA 02210 izlLer:t?L?s,OH 43215 Eglsti\gggms, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 6 | SC ] 05022025 DRB- FINAL SUBMITTAL DWNBY: SC
617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


940500

- i o
N85°00'03"E{(M) 70" WIDE RIGHT—0F—WAY
90.00'(M&P) 4SPrAl T PAVED PUBLIC ROADWAY

PE 2 PG 8

Al

UL 480" 10 THE INTERSECTION WITH WASHINGTON AVENUE.
I 185 e

HLOIM LNGW3AYd X3 282

. COMMERCE STREET \

- B T
) ww! 'y
g v Am i O, gENJAR, 77,
CIRF [ (| N #2 20N _/ \\ o ~ //
(UESRE) | % I‘,i\rbv‘*/*7/7f/*77f2; g N eo..- \CENSg ﬁb 2
o QR : . . ~
wriz PN | N 2
(07 15 o LV — | ' = ; No. 93403 L= =
' | Q7 E OF THEF \‘? | =X * R
[ [J— — . = - -
| ' [ 25 “‘L’h : . R y
| i g e ’z/%‘ STATE OF .~ lng
|1, 2% - FLoRrIDP \é\\\
S o /“ 77 / BE | tg ///.s.sl-. ....... “0\\\
N (d | 5,0 LU/ | ‘ \ h or 12 /7 / ONA‘- \\\
N e N ! - | Moy
~ | o M| g LOTS 10-12 . .
| | % | N | BLOCK 51 |
: . 5 ‘ | "OCEAN BEACH ADDITION NO. 3" (/v
lu o | N IS P.B. 2, PG. 81
S | P Ry LANDS OF
b | N01°59'57"W(M) NS LIMESTONE PLANT LL
E S | 100.000m&p) |, 7 . . C/OORION REAL ESTATE GROUP |
Lu & | '\ .. .. -  FOLIO: 02-4203-009-2100
, | N ! e O.R.B. 33193, PG. 2721'
AN | - g E
= ' S \ ze =
T NP o R B PROP RAMP WITH 0 TEW OF
Q\ % 1 - o H/}QDEQ'[;([%Z MAX) 11X125° FPL EASEMENT
E W E ) org 29046 PG 31z \ | ORE 2000 P /% S e e l
Q S o A ~BULONE 15 0.1 - = \ |
~C ;j 0 THE £ OF THE ¥ r \
_— , o
N Se 3 R I =
3 . o , )
Q- | e e S
Lk 5 PROP IE’}??IVAi()YJ_@M’i N 5 ALL y Q
~ P FENCE ENCLOSURE ek PAVED PUBLIC ALLEY 2
Lkl ———— pB 2 PG &1 ]
,—588°00°03"W(M)
90.00'(M&P)
WAL & DK IV CONCRETE W/
BAI Architecture SITE PLAN J0B#: 20040136
208 eot HA CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE: 423
51 Sleeper St. 875 N High St. 360 E 2 St. 6 Ee | 05.02.2025 |[DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DATE: 05.02.2025
6" Floor Suite 300 Suite 300 850 COMMERGE ST 2 | EE |03.04.2025 |DRB - FIRST SUBMITTAL DWN BY: EE
Boston, MA 02210 Columbus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 Rk .
617.542.1025  380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:




4/30/2025 6:31:52 PM

Autodesk Docs://20240136.00 - Cactus Club Cafe South Beach, FL/DRB Revised.rvt

25!_4||

@

1ST FLOOR: 6,890 SF

TRASH ENCLOSURE: 166 SF
EXISTING PATIO: 300 SF

EXISTING (BOH) MEZZANINE: 779 SF
NEW (DINING) MEZZANINE: 849 SF

TOTAL SF: 8,984
INTERIOR SEATS: 210

EXTERIOR SEATS: 16
SEATING IN PUBLIC WAY: NONE

RO N
o g 254 P TOTAL SEATS: 226
—————— INTERIOR OCCUPANT LOAD: 410
L " K EXTERIOR OCCUPANT LOAD: 16
(8) _ _ o I _/ (8) | TOTAL OCCUPANT LOAD: 426
\
I \ J/ TOTAL NUMBER OF PROPOSED SEATS
o IS 226, WHICH ACCOUNTS FOR ACTUAL
| OPEN TO SEATS. THE TOTAL OCCUPANT LOAD IS
426, WHICH IS CALCULATED BASED ON
_© i BELOWJll_——(c) | DESIGN LOAD FACTORS INCLUDING 18"
— - — — — - i OF BANQUETTE SEATING PER PERMIT
(0 — — — = ~ —+—(D) | COMMENTS RECEIVED FROM FIRE
i / o oe PROTECTION. SEE "05-02-25 PLANNING
| —DINING ROOMB— - ——(E) | — b —| — + +4 — ~—(E) | RESPONSE COMMENT' FOR
N SERVICE AREA ESES o \ ADDITIONAL CONTEXT ON SEAT COUNT
ST e ©o—(F) e — — — ———— : (F) | VS OCCUPANT LOAD CALCULATION
— gg =T T 7 OO O APPROVED BY PLANNING.
/
RESTROOM - [ S y
{AREA = B —— — = \Vin Wi s || )7 @
e = - S| —\I't—— ——(6) B MECHANICAL 85+ - — —~ T it = (6)
1[N | T N STORAGE [ N P | R
8 C gg . N i MEZZANINE o
| [ F 7 °BPEEL':)‘TA"3 DINING 9
| = 2 An PN B SARANEN I | 9 ;
S SR - ® e T, ~ < é &3 ®
o ummes— i 1 . N |
, = MANAGERS p N | ]
3 EMPLOYEE OFFICE STORAGE v N . i
E— =] ’_fj_‘ AREA ;‘? I] AN N 8 ,J R
CONDITIONED | b © e T
TRASH U ooo o |
5( I ;\ i |
‘ ‘ 174" 448" 262"
174" 448" 262" ;
1 PROPOSED FLOOR PLAN - 1ST FLOOR 9 PROPOSED FLOOR PLAN - MEZZ
1116"= 10" 1116"= 10"
BA' Architectu re OCCUPANT LOAD & PROPOSED SEATS JOB #: 20240136
208 got A CACTUS CLUB CAFE MIAMI BEACH SCALE:  Asindicated 4 3
5(1h Sleeper St. 87.5 N High St. 369 E2nSt. 850 COMMERCE ST DATE: 05.02.2025
Boston MA 02210 Columivus, OH 43215 Los Angeles, CA 90012 MIAMI BEACH, FL 33139 6 | SC | 05022025 |DRB - FINAL SUBMITTAL DWNBY: EP/SC
617.542.1025 380.900.8887 213.337.1090 NO.| BY DATE DESCRIPTION CROSS REF:



schesrow
Snapshot


	Sheets
	11a - FINAL SUBMITTAL (DRB25-1096) - COVER SHEET
	11c - ZONING DATA
	11d - CONTEXTUAL LOCATION PLAN
	11i.1 - CONTEXTUAL SITE PHOTOS
	11i.2 - CONTEXTUAL SITE PHOTOS
	11j.1 - CONTEXTUAL INTERIOR PHOTOS
	11j.2 - CONTEXTUAL INTERIOR PHOTOS
	11k - CONTEXTUAL EXTERIOR PHOTOS
	11l.1 - EXISTING CONDITIONS PLAN - FIRST FLOOR / MEZZ.
	11l.2 - EXISTING CONDITIONS ELEVATIONS
	11l.3 - EXISTING CONDITIONS ELEVATIONS
	11m.1 - DEMOLITION PLAN - FIRST FLOOR / MEZZ.
	11m.2 - DEMOLITION ELEVATIONS
	11m.3 - DEMOLITION ELEVATIONS
	11n.1 - PROPOSED FLOOR PLAN - FIRST FLOOR / MEZZ.
	11n.2 - PROPOSED FLOOR PLAN - ENLARGED EXTERIOR
	11n.3 - PROPOSED ROOF PLAN
	11o.1 - PROPOSED ELEVATIONS
	11o.2 - PROPOSED ELEVATIONS
	18 - CONTEXTUAL ELEVATION LINE DRAWINGS
	27 - SCHEMATIC SIGNAGE PROGRAM
	43 - OCCUPANT LOAD & PROPOSED SEATS




